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The global financial crisis triggered severe shocks for developing countries, whose embrace of greater
commercial and financial openness has increased their exposure to external shocks, both real and financial.
This new edition of Development Macroeconomics has been fully revised to address the more open and less
stable environment in which developing countries operate today.

Describing the latest advances in this rapidly changing field, the book features expanded coverage of public
debt and the management of capital inflows as well as new material on fiscal discipline, monetary policy
regimes, currency, banking and sovereign debt crises, currency unions, and the choice of an exchange-rate
regime. A new chapter on dynamic stochastic general equilibrium (DSGE) models with financial frictions
has been added to reflect how the financial crisis has reshaped our thinking on the role of such frictions in
generating and propagating real and financial shocks. The book also discusses the role of macroprudential
regulation, both independently and through its interactions with monetary policy, in preserving financial and
macroeconomic stability.

Now in its fourth edition, Development Macroeconomics remains the definitive textbook on the
macroeconomics of developing countries.

The most authoritative book on the subject--now fully revised and expanded●

Features new material on fiscal discipline, monetary policy regimes, currency, banking and sovereign debt●

crises, and much more
Comes with online supplements on informal financial markets, stabilization programs, the solution of●

DSGE models with financial frictions, and exchange rate crises
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From reader reviews:

Jenifer Bell:

This Development Macroeconomics: Fourth edition book is just not ordinary book, you have after that it the
world is in your hands. The benefit you get by reading this book is information inside this guide incredible
fresh, you will get facts which is getting deeper an individual read a lot of information you will get. That
Development Macroeconomics: Fourth edition without we comprehend teach the one who studying it
become critical in considering and analyzing. Don't always be worry Development Macroeconomics: Fourth
edition can bring any time you are and not make your handbag space or bookshelves' become full because
you can have it in the lovely laptop even mobile phone. This Development Macroeconomics: Fourth edition
having very good arrangement in word as well as layout, so you will not truly feel uninterested in reading.

Terry Smith:

The book Development Macroeconomics: Fourth edition has a lot associated with on it. So when you read
this book you can get a lot of help. The book was authored by the very famous author. This articles author
makes some research ahead of write this book. That book very easy to read you may get the point easily after
scanning this book.

Willa Killeen:

The book untitled Development Macroeconomics: Fourth edition contain a lot of information on the item.
The writer explains the woman idea with easy method. The language is very clear to see all the people, so do
certainly not worry, you can easy to read the item. The book was authored by famous author. The author
gives you in the new period of literary works. You can actually read this book because you can continue
reading your smart phone, or product, so you can read the book inside anywhere and anytime. In a situation
you wish to purchase the e-book, you can open their official web-site and order it. Have a nice read.

Ronald Peyton:

That publication can make you to feel relax. This specific book Development Macroeconomics: Fourth
edition was colorful and of course has pictures on there. As we know that book Development
Macroeconomics: Fourth edition has many kinds or genre. Start from kids until young adults. For example
Naruto or Private eye Conan you can read and believe that you are the character on there. So , not at all of
book are make you bored, any it offers up you feel happy, fun and chill out. Try to choose the best book to
suit your needs and try to like reading which.
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