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Did Martin Luther wield his hammer on the Wittenberg church door on October 31, 1517? Did he even post
the Ninety-five Theses at all? This collection of documents sheds light on the debate surrounding Luther's
actions and the timing of his writing and his request for a disputation on the indulgence issue. The primary
documents in this book include the theses, their companion sermon ("A Sermon on Indulgence and Grace",
1518), a chronoloical arrangement of letters pertinent to the theses, and selections from Luther's Table Talk
that address the Ninety-five Theses. A final section contains Luther's recollections, which offer today's
reader the reformer's own views of the Reformation and the Ninety-five Theses.
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From reader reviews:

Harold Froelich:

The event that you get from Martin Luther's 95 Theses is a more deep you searching the information that
hide into the words the more you get interested in reading it. It does not mean that this book is hard to
understand but Martin Luther's 95 Theses giving you excitement feeling of reading. The author conveys their
point in certain way that can be understood through anyone who read that because the author of this reserve
is well-known enough. This kind of book also makes your own vocabulary increase well. Making it easy to
understand then can go together with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We advise you for
having this specific Martin Luther's 95 Theses instantly.

Melvin Bragg:

The book Martin Luther's 95 Theses has a lot associated with on it. So when you read this book you can get a
lot of advantage. The book was published by the very famous author. The author makes some research prior
to write this book. This book very easy to read you may get the point easily after looking over this book.

Martin Hanson:

People live in this new moment of lifestyle always attempt to and must have the extra time or they will get
large amount of stress from both daily life and work. So , if we ask do people have free time, we will say
absolutely of course. People is human not a robot. Then we ask again, what kind of activity are you
experiencing when the spare time coming to anyone of course your answer will unlimited right. Then do you
ever try this one, reading textbooks. It can be your alternative with spending your spare time, the actual book
you have read will be Martin Luther's 95 Theses.

Shirley Drago:

This Martin Luther's 95 Theses is completely new way for you who has curiosity to look for some
information mainly because it relief your hunger associated with. Getting deeper you into it getting
knowledge more you know or you who still having little bit of digest in reading this Martin Luther's 95
Theses can be the light food in your case because the information inside this particular book is easy to get
simply by anyone. These books produce itself in the form that is reachable by anyone, yeah I mean in the e-
book web form. People who think that in guide form make them feel drowsy even dizzy this book is the
answer. So there is not any in reading a publication especially this one. You can find actually looking for. It
should be here for an individual. So , don't miss that! Just read this e-book kind for your better life in
addition to knowledge.
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