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A comprehensive guide on what to expect when owning and operating this type of business, this book
includes everything from choosing a unique identity to roasting, making, and serving coffee, espresso, and
tea. Learn the steps to:

* Turning beans into bucks

* Building a winning sales team

* Providing WOW! customer service

The two authors share their inside perspective on running a coffee bar, answering questions such as:

* How do I prepare a business plan?

* How do I market my coffee bar?

* What special equipment will I need?

* What will it cost to get started?

* What should I look for when choosing a location?

* How do I roast coffee beans and brew a great cup of coffee?

* What are the 11 steps to WOW! customer service?

* What about expansion and franchising?

The book includes sections on organic and Fair Trade coffee, recipes for specialty coffees, and forms to help
you with the day-to-day logistics of running a coffee bar.
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From reader reviews:

Frances Williamson:

Information is provisions for those to get better life, information currently can get by anyone with
everywhere. The information can be a expertise or any news even a concern. What people must be consider
whenever those information which is inside former life are challenging be find than now's taking seriously
which one would work to believe or which one the resource are convinced. If you receive the unstable
resource then you understand it as your main information there will be huge disadvantage for you. All those
possibilities will not happen inside you if you take Start & Run A Coffee Bar (Start and Run A) as the daily
resource information.

Willie Clark:

This book untitled Start & Run A Coffee Bar (Start and Run A) to be one of several books that will best
seller in this year, that's because when you read this e-book you can get a lot of benefit in it. You will easily
to buy this kind of book in the book retail outlet or you can order it by way of online. The publisher with this
book sells the e-book too. It makes you quickly to read this book, since you can read this book in your
Mobile phone. So there is no reason to your account to past this guide from your list.

Shawna Vaughn:

Spent a free time for you to be fun activity to try and do! A lot of people spent their down time with their
family, or all their friends. Usually they accomplishing activity like watching television, going to beach, or
picnic from the park. They actually doing ditto every week. Do you feel it? Do you want to something
different to fill your personal free time/ holiday? May be reading a book can be option to fill your no cost
time/ holiday. The first thing that you'll ask may be what kinds of book that you should read. If you want to
consider look for book, may be the reserve untitled Start & Run A Coffee Bar (Start and Run A) can be very
good book to read. May be it could be best activity to you.

Hayden Wright:

Do you have something that you like such as book? The e-book lovers usually prefer to decide on book like
comic, short story and the biggest the first is novel. Now, why not attempting Start & Run A Coffee Bar
(Start and Run A) that give your entertainment preference will be satisfied by reading this book. Reading
addiction all over the world can be said as the means for people to know world far better then how they react
towards the world. It can't be mentioned constantly that reading routine only for the geeky man or woman
but for all of you who wants to end up being success person. So , for all you who want to start reading as
your good habit, you can pick Start & Run A Coffee Bar (Start and Run A) become your starter.
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