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California is home to a wide variety of highly accomplished--in some cases, world-renowned--poets. Ripe
with beauty, politics, and an endless diversity of people and cultures, California has nurtured poets born and
raised on its soil, and drawn to it established writers from other places. The Geography of Home brings
together the works of seventy-six important gures in contemporary California poetry, including Philip
Levine, Peter Everwine, Mark Jarman, Adrienne Rich, Dennis Schmitz, Carolyn Kizer, Gary Soto, Al
Young, Kim Addonizio, Charles Wright, Carol Muske, David St. John, Larry Levis, Robert Hass, Gary
Snyder, William Everson, Gary Soto, Luis Omar Salinas, Diane Wakoski, Garrett Hongo, Jane Hirsheld, and
Brenda Hillman. Through the multiple selections for each poet, we can witness connections to California,
visions of the place poets have at one time or other called home. Additionally, the poets have written
introductory statements expressly for this anthology that will speak to their history in California, and to the
inuence of the state on their poetry.In this long-awaited collection, California's unique and complex
geography is examined, questioned, and ultimately celebrated, through forms as varied, dynamic, and
compelling as the state itself.
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From reader reviews:

Emily Walker:

Have you spare time for a day? What do you do when you have considerably more or little spare time? Yeah,
you can choose the suitable activity for spend your time. Any person spent their own spare time to take a
stroll, shopping, or went to the actual Mall. How about open or read a book entitled The Geography Of
Home: California's Poetry Of Place (California Poetry Series)? Maybe it is to become best activity for you.
You already know beside you can spend your time with the favorite's book, you can smarter than before. Do
you agree with it is opinion or you have additional opinion?

Dennis Byrd:

As people who live in the particular modest era should be up-date about what going on or information even
knowledge to make these people keep up with the era that is certainly always change and progress. Some of
you maybe may update themselves by studying books. It is a good choice for you but the problems coming
to anyone is you don't know which you should start with. This The Geography Of Home: California's Poetry
Of Place (California Poetry Series) is our recommendation so you keep up with the world. Why, as this book
serves what you want and want in this era.

Claude Gonzalez:

Reading a guide can be one of a lot of activity that everyone in the world likes. Do you like reading book
therefore. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoy it. First reading a publication will give you a lot of
new information. When you read a publication you will get new information since book is one of many ways
to share the information or even their idea. Second, studying a book will make anyone more imaginative.
When you reading through a book especially fictional works book the author will bring someone to imagine
the story how the characters do it anything. Third, you could share your knowledge to other folks. When you
read this The Geography Of Home: California's Poetry Of Place (California Poetry Series), you could tells
your family, friends in addition to soon about yours book. Your knowledge can inspire average, make them
reading a publication.

Kenneth Quisenberry:

As a university student exactly feel bored in order to reading. If their teacher asked them to go to the library
or make summary for some publication, they are complained. Just little students that has reading's soul or
real their interest. They just do what the educator want, like asked to go to the library. They go to presently
there but nothing reading really. Any students feel that studying is not important, boring and also can't see
colorful photos on there. Yeah, it is for being complicated. Book is very important for you. As we know that
on this era, many ways to get whatever you want. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's country.
Therefore , this The Geography Of Home: California's Poetry Of Place (California Poetry Series) can make
you really feel more interested to read.
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