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This no-nonsense guide to canning, freezing, curing, and smoking meat, fish, and game is written in down-
to-earth, informative, everyday language. The third edition of this perennial bestseller is completely revised
and updated to comply with the latest USDA health and safety guidelines. Includes dozens of delicious
recipes for homemade Beef Jerky, Pemmican, Venison Mincemeat, Corned Beef, Gepockelete (German-
style cured pork), Bacon, Canadian Bacon, Smoked Sausage, Liverwurst, Bologna, Pepperoni, Fish
Chowder, Cured Turkey, and a variety of hams. Learn tasty pickling methods for tripe, fish, beef, pork, and
oysters. An excellent resource for anyone who loves meat but hates the steroids and chemicals in
commercially available products.
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From reader reviews:

Richard Riggins:

A Guide to Canning, Freezing, Curing & Smoking Meat, Fish & Game can be one of your starter books that
are good idea. Most of us recommend that straight away because this book has good vocabulary that may
increase your knowledge in vocabulary, easy to understand, bit entertaining but nonetheless delivering the
information. The writer giving his/her effort to set every word into satisfaction arrangement in writing A
Guide to Canning, Freezing, Curing & Smoking Meat, Fish & Game but doesn't forget the main place,
giving the reader the hottest along with based confirm resource facts that maybe you can be one of it. This
great information may drawn you into fresh stage of crucial pondering.

Patricia Rhee:

That publication can make you to feel relax. This kind of book A Guide to Canning, Freezing, Curing &
Smoking Meat, Fish & Game was multi-colored and of course has pictures on the website. As we know that
book A Guide to Canning, Freezing, Curing & Smoking Meat, Fish & Game has many kinds or type. Start
from kids until youngsters. For example Naruto or Private investigator Conan you can read and believe that
you are the character on there. So , not at all of book are generally make you bored, any it offers up you feel
happy, fun and unwind. Try to choose the best book for you personally and try to like reading in which.

Deborah Allen:

What is your hobby? Have you heard in which question when you got college students? We believe that that
issue was given by teacher for their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everyone has different hobby. And you
know that little person similar to reading or as reading become their hobby. You must know that reading is
very important in addition to book as to be the point. Book is important thing to include you knowledge,
except your own teacher or lecturer. You get good news or update about something by book. Amount types
of books that can you take to be your object. One of them are these claims A Guide to Canning, Freezing,
Curing & Smoking Meat, Fish & Game.

Mildred Bostwick:

Reading a book make you to get more knowledge from this. You can take knowledge and information from
the book. Book is composed or printed or created from each source which filled update of news. In this
modern era like right now, many ways to get information are available for anyone. From media social like
newspaper, magazines, science guide, encyclopedia, reference book, book and comic. You can add your
understanding by that book. Do you want to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just in search
of the A Guide to Canning, Freezing, Curing & Smoking Meat, Fish & Game when you essential it?
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