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“...laugh out loud moments on nearly every page...”

”...had me laughing from beginning to end...”

“...loved the book - funny and engaging...”

“...read it, love it, recommend it...”

George Mahood had a nice, easy, comfortable life. He had a job, a house, a wife and kids. But something
was missing. He was stuck in a routine of working, changing nappies and cleaning up cat sick. He felt like he
was missing out on a lot of what the world had to offer. He then discovered that it was Bubble Wrap
Appreciation Day. The day after that was National Curmudgeon Day, and the day after that was Inane
Answering Machine Message Day. In fact, the calendar is FULL of these quirky, weird and wonderful
events. He realised that somebody somewhere had created these holidays, believing that they were important
enough to warrant their own official day. Surely he should therefore be more appreciative of their existence?
So he decided to try and celebrate them all. As you do. He hoped that at the end of the challenge he would be
transformed into a happier, more intelligent and more content person. Follow George on his hilarious, life
changing adventure as he tries to balance his normal life with a wealth of new experiences, people, facts and
ridiculous situations. It’s a rip-roaring, life-affirming, roller-coaster of a ride, where every day is a holiday.
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From reader reviews:

David Marx:

Book is to be different for every single grade. Book for children right up until adult are different content. To
be sure that book is very important for people. The book Every Day Is a Holiday ended up being making you
to know about other expertise and of course you can take more information. It is very advantages for you.
The book Every Day Is a Holiday is not only giving you a lot more new information but also for being your
friend when you experience bored. You can spend your own spend time to read your guide. Try to make
relationship together with the book Every Day Is a Holiday. You never sense lose out for everything should
you read some books.

James Baker:

Here thing why this particular Every Day Is a Holiday are different and reliable to be yours. First of all
reading a book is good nonetheless it depends in the content of computer which is the content is as
scrumptious as food or not. Every Day Is a Holiday giving you information deeper and different ways, you
can find any book out there but there is no book that similar with Every Day Is a Holiday. It gives you thrill
looking at journey, its open up your own eyes about the thing which happened in the world which is maybe
can be happened around you. It is possible to bring everywhere like in park, café, or even in your approach
home by train. For anyone who is having difficulties in bringing the published book maybe the form of
Every Day Is a Holiday in e-book can be your substitute.

Michael Larose:

That book can make you to feel relax. That book Every Day Is a Holiday was vibrant and of course has
pictures on there. As we know that book Every Day Is a Holiday has many kinds or style. Start from kids
until adolescents. For example Naruto or Private investigator Conan you can read and believe that you are
the character on there. Therefore not at all of book are usually make you bored, any it offers you feel happy,
fun and chill out. Try to choose the best book in your case and try to like reading in which.

Russell Fielder:

Some individuals said that they feel uninterested when they reading a book. They are directly felt the item
when they get a half elements of the book. You can choose the actual book Every Day Is a Holiday to make
your personal reading is interesting. Your current skill of reading expertise is developing when you like
reading. Try to choose easy book to make you enjoy to study it and mingle the opinion about book and
examining especially. It is to be initial opinion for you to like to wide open a book and study it. Beside that
the e-book Every Day Is a Holiday can to be your brand new friend when you're really feel alone and
confuse using what must you're doing of the time.
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