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An art form in Japan, sushi is not only beautifully presented but healthy and delicious.

Fresh and delicious, sushi is one of the healthiest foods you can eat, as it's low in fat and high in essential
vitamins and minerals. Aesthetically pleasing, sushi is also surprisingly simple to make. From traditional
hand-rolled sushi to the modern sushi in a bowl, this sushi cookbook will show you how to make these
elegant dishes with ease.

Sushi can be found in grocery stores and restaurants across the country. A traditional Japanese food, sushi is
now a part of the American culture. Fresh, healthy, low in fat and aesthetically pleasing, sushi is an art form
in Japan. Now, with this practical sushi recipe book, you can make your own sushi at home.

Step-by-step instructions and photographs show how to make a variety of sushi and sashimi. Also found in
Sushi is information on the history and the healthy benefits of Japanese sushi, as well as directions on using
sushi-making tools, making perfect sushi rice, how to cut vegetables and decorations, and selecting fresh
fish.

The recipes, including Nigiri, Vegetable Sushi, Sushi in a Bowl, and sushi rolls like California Rolls,
Thin Rolls and Hand Rolls, are easy to follow and are suitable for both beginners and experienced cooks.
Filled with elegant and stylish photographs, this sushi book is a must for your collection.
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From reader reviews:

Jorge Hinkley:

Book is to be different per grade. Book for children right up until adult are different content. To be sure that
book is very important normally. The book Sushi (Essential Kitchen Series) had been making you to know
about other understanding and of course you can take more information. It is rather advantages for you. The
guide Sushi (Essential Kitchen Series) is not only giving you much more new information but also being
your friend when you really feel bored. You can spend your own spend time to read your publication. Try to
make relationship using the book Sushi (Essential Kitchen Series). You never truly feel lose out for
everything in the event you read some books.

Martha Williams:

Spent a free time for you to be fun activity to do! A lot of people spent their free time with their family, or
their own friends. Usually they performing activity like watching television, likely to beach, or picnic in the
park. They actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Do you need to something different to fill your
current free time/ holiday? Might be reading a book might be option to fill your free of charge time/ holiday.
The first thing you ask may be what kinds of book that you should read. If you want to try out look for book,
may be the publication untitled Sushi (Essential Kitchen Series) can be fine book to read. May be it might be
best activity to you.

Joan Hanson:

Do you have something that you prefer such as book? The reserve lovers usually prefer to choose book like
comic, short story and the biggest some may be novel. Now, why not hoping Sushi (Essential Kitchen
Series) that give your pleasure preference will be satisfied through reading this book. Reading practice all
over the world can be said as the means for people to know world much better then how they react when it
comes to the world. It can't be said constantly that reading behavior only for the geeky individual but for all
of you who wants to be success person. So , for all of you who want to start reading through as your good
habit, you are able to pick Sushi (Essential Kitchen Series) become your current starter.

Gloria Quinones:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray you actually, why because this Sushi (Essential Kitchen Series)
publication written by well-known writer who knows well how to make book which might be understand by
anyone who have read the book. Written throughout good manner for you, still dripping wet every ideas and
creating skill only for eliminate your own hunger then you still hesitation Sushi (Essential Kitchen Series) as
good book not simply by the cover but also by content. This is one publication that can break don't ascertain
book by its protect, so do you still needing yet another sixth sense to pick this!? Oh come on your studying
sixth sense already alerted you so why you have to listening to an additional sixth sense.
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