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Volume One takes the reader from the Barrios of Bogotá through the intrigues of Manchuria and war-torn
South-East Asia to the slums and skyscrapers of New York City, the latter as seen through the eyes of the
truant, Lee Harvey Oswald.

Within a year of formation in 1947, the CIA committed what was probably its first major act. It involved an
assassination using a designated patsy. Time and place: Bogotá, April 9, 1948 - the victim, the youthful and
charismatic presidential front-runner, Jorge Eliécer Gaitán.

The entire scenario would be replicated 20 years later in Los Angeles with another youthful and charismatic
presidential front-runner - right down to a patsy using self-hypnosis and connected to the California cult
known as AMORC.

And somewhere in between the two slayings was the assassination of JFK and the circuitous path to Dallas
taken by patsy-in-the-making, Lee Harvey Oswald - the most intriguingly enigmatic alleged assassin of them
all.

Volume Two picks up where Volume One left off.

Marguerite and young Lee have left New York City and returned to Lee's place of birth, New Orleans. Lee
seems more like a "normal" kid than ever before. He gets into scrapes at school, joins clubs and keeps a
weather eye on the wide world around him. But dig deeper and he is immersed in memorizing the Marines
Manual and Das Kapital under the guidance of Captain Dave whom Lee has met in the Civil Air Patrol
(CAP). Moreover, he is playing entrapment games with his friends. Has Captain Dave (David Ferrie)
recruited Lee into a cadre of teenage anti-subversive agents in a program first floated by the CAP some
seven years earlier? Was this program, which included teaching young recruits how to speak Russian, the
seeds of what became the False Defector Program?

In 1956, Lee is once again uprooted - this time moving to Forth Worth where he gets caught up in the riots
brought about by forced integration pursuant to the Brown v Board of Education decision. Meanwhile, the
Hungarian Uprising is waiting to explode in Europe.

Also in 1956, Ruth Paine's sister, Sylvia Hoke finished work on a CIA project. The nature of the project is
revealed here for the first time.

Then in October, on his 17th birthday, Lee joins the Marines. We review his service record and explain some
of the anomalies within it.

Lastly, we have a look at the very spooky Albert Schweitzer College in Switzerland, which Lee had paid a
$25 deposit to attend, but instead had headed to the Soviet Union. The Nazi and doomsday cult connections



to the college are exposed, as are US government ties.

This edition includes a bonus timeline at Appendix A.
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From reader reviews:

Michael Auten:

Do you have something that you enjoy such as book? The reserve lovers usually prefer to pick book like
comic, limited story and the biggest you are novel. Now, why not trying Lee Harvey Oswald's Cold War:
Why the Kennedy Assassination should be Reinvestigated - Volumes One & Two that give your enjoyment
preference will be satisfied simply by reading this book. Reading practice all over the world can be said as
the opportinity for people to know world much better then how they react to the world. It can't be claimed
constantly that reading practice only for the geeky particular person but for all of you who wants to end up
being success person. So , for all of you who want to start examining as your good habit, you may pick Lee
Harvey Oswald's Cold War: Why the Kennedy Assassination should be Reinvestigated - Volumes One &
Two become your own personal starter.

Amy Nichols:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray anyone, why because this Lee Harvey Oswald's Cold War: Why the
Kennedy Assassination should be Reinvestigated - Volumes One & Two publication written by well-known
writer who knows well how to make book that can be understand by anyone who all read the book. Written
throughout good manner for you, dripping every ideas and creating skill only for eliminate your current
hunger then you still hesitation Lee Harvey Oswald's Cold War: Why the Kennedy Assassination should be
Reinvestigated - Volumes One & Two as good book not only by the cover but also by the content. This is
one publication that can break don't ascertain book by its protect, so do you still needing one more sixth
sense to pick this particular!? Oh come on your looking at sixth sense already alerted you so why you have to
listening to a different sixth sense.

Jennifer Klein:

Reading a book to be new life style in this yr; every people loves to go through a book. When you read a
book you can get a large amount of benefit. When you read textbooks, you can improve your knowledge,
mainly because book has a lot of information on it. The information that you will get depend on what types
of book that you have read. If you would like get information about your analysis, you can read education
books, but if you want to entertain yourself read a fiction books, such us novel, comics, and also soon. The
Lee Harvey Oswald's Cold War: Why the Kennedy Assassination should be Reinvestigated - Volumes One
& Two provide you with a new experience in reading through a book.

Paul England:

Reading a e-book make you to get more knowledge from this. You can take knowledge and information
coming from a book. Book is composed or printed or highlighted from each source that will filled update of
news. On this modern era like now, many ways to get information are available for anyone. From media
social just like newspaper, magazines, science publication, encyclopedia, reference book, book and comic.



You can add your knowledge by that book. Do you want to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just
seeking the Lee Harvey Oswald's Cold War: Why the Kennedy Assassination should be Reinvestigated -
Volumes One & Two when you desired it?
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