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From the author of the Revelation Space series comes an interstellar adventure of war, identity, betrayal, and
the preservation of civilization itself.

A vast conflict, one that has encompassed hundreds of worlds and solar systems, appears to be finally at an
end. A conscripted soldier is beginning to consider her life after the war and the family she has left behind.
But for Scur—and for humanity—peace is not to be.

On the brink of the ceasefire, Scur is captured by a renegade war criminal, and left for dead in the ruins of a
bunker. She revives aboard a prisoner transport vessel. Something has gone terribly wrong with the ship.

Passengers—combatants from both sides of the war—are waking up from hibernation far too soon. Their
memories, embedded in bullets, are the only links to a world which is no longer recognizable. And Scur will
be reacquainted with her old enemy, but with much higher stakes than just her own life.
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From reader reviews:

Matthew Venegas:

People live in this new day time of lifestyle always try and and must have the extra time or they will get wide
range of stress from both way of life and work. So , once we ask do people have free time, we will say
absolutely sure. People is human not really a huge robot. Then we ask again, what kind of activity do you
possess when the spare time coming to anyone of course your answer can unlimited right. Then do you ever
try this one, reading books. It can be your alternative with spending your spare time, typically the book you
have read is definitely Slow Bullets.

William McClanahan:

Reading a book to become new life style in this calendar year; every people loves to go through a book.
When you examine a book you can get a lots of benefit. When you read textbooks, you can improve your
knowledge, since book has a lot of information upon it. The information that you will get depend on what
sorts of book that you have read. If you need to get information about your review, you can read education
books, but if you want to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, these kinds of us novel, comics, and
soon. The Slow Bullets will give you new experience in studying a book.

Joel Kiser:

Is it anyone who having spare time then spend it whole day through watching television programs or just
laying on the bed? Do you need something new? This Slow Bullets can be the reply, oh how comes? A fresh
book you know. You are therefore out of date, spending your extra time by reading in this fresh era is
common not a geek activity. So what these books have than the others?

Diana Johnson:

Some people said that they feel fed up when they reading a publication. They are directly felt the idea when
they get a half portions of the book. You can choose the book Slow Bullets to make your reading is
interesting. Your own skill of reading talent is developing when you just like reading. Try to choose basic
book to make you enjoy to read it and mingle the opinion about book and examining especially. It is to be
first opinion for you to like to available a book and read it. Beside that the book Slow Bullets can to be your
friend when you're feel alone and confuse with what must you're doing of these time.
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