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Why are the Daltons trying to get inside a penitentiary?

Transferred to a new penitentiary, the Daltons are put in a cell with Fennimore Buttercup, a counterfeiter
who soon begins to regret having such noisy cellmates. To get rid of the annoying brothers, he sends them on
the trail of his – made-up – stash: $100,000 buried at the foot of a boulder in Red Rock Junction. One prison
escape later, pursued by Lucky Luke, they discover to their horror that the spot they seek ... is inside another
penitentiary!

The 58th adventure of Lucky Luke, and the Old West at its funniest!
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From reader reviews:

Jessica Bradsher:

Spent a free the perfect time to be fun activity to perform! A lot of people spent their leisure time with their
family, or their friends. Usually they accomplishing activity like watching television, likely to beach, or
picnic within the park. They actually doing same thing every week. Do you feel it? Would you like to
something different to fill your own personal free time/ holiday? Could possibly be reading a book is usually
option to fill your totally free time/ holiday. The first thing that you ask may be what kinds of reserve that
you should read. If you want to try look for book, may be the guide untitled The Daltons' Stash (Lucky Luke)
can be very good book to read. May be it might be best activity to you.

Douglas Wyss:

People live in this new morning of lifestyle always make an effort to and must have the time or they will get
great deal of stress from both everyday life and work. So , when we ask do people have extra time, we will
say absolutely yes. People is human not a robot. Then we consult again, what kind of activity have you got
when the spare time coming to a person of course your answer can unlimited right. Then do you ever try this
one, reading textbooks. It can be your alternative inside spending your spare time, often the book you have
read will be The Daltons' Stash (Lucky Luke).

Scarlet Rome:

Are you kind of occupied person, only have 10 as well as 15 minute in your moment to upgrading your mind
ability or thinking skill perhaps analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book when
compared with can satisfy your short time to read it because pretty much everything time you only find e-
book that need more time to be read. The Daltons' Stash (Lucky Luke) can be your answer mainly because it
can be read by anyone who have those short spare time problems.

Ana Worcester:

On this era which is the greater man or woman or who has ability in doing something more are more
precious than other. Do you want to become one among it? It is just simple solution to have that. What you
are related is just spending your time little but quite enough to have a look at some books. One of many
books in the top checklist in your reading list is actually The Daltons' Stash (Lucky Luke). This book that is
certainly qualified as The Hungry Inclines can get you closer in becoming precious person. By looking up
and review this book you can get many advantages.
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