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Vincent van Gogh drew thousands of images to better his style. He believed that drawing was “the root of
everything” and completed over 1,000 drawings from 1877 to 1890. His drawings were mainly done in
pencil, black chalk, red chalk, blue chalk, reed pen and charcoal on a variety of paper types these included
Ingres paper, laid paper, wove paper. At the outset of his career, he felt it necessary to master black and
white before attempting to work in color. Thus, drawings formed an inextricable part of his development as a
painter. There were periods when he wished to do nothing but draw. Although his paintings are much more
popular than his drawings, Van Gogh is considered a master of drawing. Similar to his drawings, Van Gogh
often did watercolors as studies before doing an oil painting or as practice. As he continued to refine his
technique, he used more and brighter colors in his watercolors. He produced nearly 150 watercolor paintings
during his life.
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From reader reviews:

Jose Callender:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important take action, like
looking for your favorite reserve and reading a e-book. Beside you can solve your condition; you can add
your knowledge by the reserve entitled Vincent Van Gogh: 120 Drawings and Watercolors. Try to make
book Vincent Van Gogh: 120 Drawings and Watercolors as your friend. It means that it can to be your friend
when you really feel alone and beside those of course make you smarter than ever. Yeah, it is very fortuned
in your case. The book makes you far more confidence because you can know every little thing by the book.
So , we need to make new experience along with knowledge with this book.

Paul Gay:

Book is to be different per grade. Book for children till adult are different content. To be sure that book is
very important for all of us. The book Vincent Van Gogh: 120 Drawings and Watercolors had been making
you to know about other know-how and of course you can take more information. It is very advantages for
you. The publication Vincent Van Gogh: 120 Drawings and Watercolors is not only giving you a lot more
new information but also to be your friend when you feel bored. You can spend your personal spend time to
read your e-book. Try to make relationship while using book Vincent Van Gogh: 120 Drawings and
Watercolors. You never sense lose out for everything when you read some books.

Darla Kemp:

The particular book Vincent Van Gogh: 120 Drawings and Watercolors has a lot associated with on it. So
when you read this book you can get a lot of profit. The book was written by the very famous author. The
writer makes some research before write this book. That book very easy to read you may get the point easily
after reading this article book.

Maria Lamotte:

E-book is one of source of information. We can add our knowledge from it. Not only for students but
additionally native or citizen need book to know the change information of year to year. As we know those
publications have many advantages. Beside all of us add our knowledge, may also bring us to around the
world. By the book Vincent Van Gogh: 120 Drawings and Watercolors we can have more advantage. Don't
one to be creative people? For being creative person must like to read a book. Merely choose the best book
that suitable with your aim. Don't be doubt to change your life at this book Vincent Van Gogh: 120 Drawings
and Watercolors. You can more appealing than now.
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