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This is a must-have book for anyone who practices, or is interested in, acceptance and commitment therapy
(ACT).

Most people in the psychological community are familiar with the concept of cognitive defusion. This
important practice rests on the premise that many of our thoughts, particularly self-evaluative thoughts (I’m
not good enough, There’s something wrong with me, etc.), do not capture the full reality of a situation.
Defusion techniques are used to undermine the authoritative nature of our thoughts, to expose them as simply
words, rather than truths etched in stone.

Designed for use by mental health professionals and graduate students, Cognitive Defusion In Practice
clearly conceptualizes cognitive defusion—an integral aspect of acceptance and commitment therapy
(ACT)—for accessible and practical reference. The book also provides comprehensive descriptions of a great
variety of defusion techniques, and illustrates how and when to introduce defusion in therapy.

This is a comprehensive, definitive, authoritative text on cognitive defusion: what it is, how to use it in
session, and why it works. Because cognitive defusion is so effective, a great variety of defusion techniques
are used in ACT to help clients gain greater psychological flexibility, but before now, there has not been a
definitive resource available that outlines the practice in detail. This book will make a wonderful addition to
your professional library, and will greatly enhance your delivery of ACT.
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From reader reviews:

Eleanor Rowe:

Book will be written, printed, or highlighted for everything. You can recognize everything you want by a
publication. Book has a different type. As it is known to us that book is important thing to bring us around
the world. Beside that you can your reading ability was fluently. A guide Cognitive Defusion in Practice: A
Clinician's Guide to Assessing, Observing, and Supporting Change in Your Client (The Context Press
Mastering ACT Series) will make you to always be smarter. You can feel far more confidence if you can
know about every little thing. But some of you think which open or reading a new book make you bored. It's
not make you fun. Why they may be thought like that? Have you looking for best book or ideal book with
you?

Ella Cook:

Book is to be different for every grade. Book for children until finally adult are different content. To be sure
that book is very important for all of us. The book Cognitive Defusion in Practice: A Clinician's Guide to
Assessing, Observing, and Supporting Change in Your Client (The Context Press Mastering ACT Series) has
been making you to know about other information and of course you can take more information. It is rather
advantages for you. The reserve Cognitive Defusion in Practice: A Clinician's Guide to Assessing,
Observing, and Supporting Change in Your Client (The Context Press Mastering ACT Series) is not only
giving you a lot more new information but also for being your friend when you experience bored. You can
spend your own personal spend time to read your e-book. Try to make relationship together with the book
Cognitive Defusion in Practice: A Clinician's Guide to Assessing, Observing, and Supporting Change in
Your Client (The Context Press Mastering ACT Series). You never sense lose out for everything in case you
read some books.

Jane Moore:

In this 21st centuries, people become competitive in every way. By being competitive currently, people have
do something to make all of them survives, being in the middle of the particular crowded place and notice by
surrounding. One thing that sometimes many people have underestimated it for a while is reading. Yes, by
reading a e-book your ability to survive boost then having chance to endure than other is high. In your case
who want to start reading a book, we give you this Cognitive Defusion in Practice: A Clinician's Guide to
Assessing, Observing, and Supporting Change in Your Client (The Context Press Mastering ACT Series)
book as beginning and daily reading book. Why, because this book is greater than just a book.

Arturo Lamb:

Many people spending their period by playing outside having friends, fun activity with family or just
watching TV the whole day. You can have new activity to enjoy your whole day by examining a book. Ugh,



you think reading a book can really hard because you have to use the book everywhere? It ok you can have
the e-book, delivering everywhere you want in your Smartphone. Like Cognitive Defusion in Practice: A
Clinician's Guide to Assessing, Observing, and Supporting Change in Your Client (The Context Press
Mastering ACT Series) which is having the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's observe.
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