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A God for the Twenty-first Century. Does life have any meaning or purpose? Does God exist? How can you
reconcile a loving God with cruelty and suffering? This book makes the radical claim that the universe is
literally a game of God. One purpose of the universe is for God to enjoy the vast array of experiences that
God, as an unlimited being, cannot experience: life and death, joy and pain, beginning and end, fear and hate,
happiness and sorrow. In order to have a realistic experience of limitation, God must forget that She-He-It is
God. The universe is a game in which God forgets His-Her-Its identity and in the process of playing
remembers who She-He-It is. We are not separate creatures who are victims of existence. We are expressions
of God experiencing limitation and overcoming it. We are God in disguise. Human suffering comes from the
erroneous belief that who we really are is our personality, or ego-identity. Our lives are a constant battle for
the survival of a mistaken identity; we spend most of our time either flighting from reality or fighting it.
Love and transcendence lie in the cessation of survival behavior, in the acceptance of reality (what is). Love
is the experience of unconditional acceptance of what is. With a cartoon on every left-hand page illustrating
the text on the right, formatted like poetry, these ideas are presented in a light and humorous manner. Tim
Allen says, "If you really have your shit together, read this book.” (From the suggested reading list in his
bestseller, “I'm Not Really Here.”) Oprah called it, “A great book about God.” This is a revised edition of the
1993 book, which reflects the latest thinking of the authors and includes some new cartoons.
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From reader reviews:

Bill Boyd:

The event that you get from The Game of God: Recovering Your True Identity could be the more deep you
searching the information that hide into the words the more you get serious about reading it. It doesn't mean
that this book is hard to recognise but The Game of God: Recovering Your True Identity giving you buzz
feeling of reading. The copy writer conveys their point in selected way that can be understood by anyone
who read that because the author of this guide is well-known enough. This particular book also makes your
own vocabulary increase well. Therefore it is easy to understand then can go to you, both in printed or e-
book style are available. We highly recommend you for having this particular The Game of God: Recovering
Your True Identity instantly.

Mark Johnson:

You are able to spend your free time you just read this book this reserve. This The Game of God: Recovering
Your True Identity is simple to develop you can read it in the playground, in the beach, train and also soon.
If you did not possess much space to bring often the printed book, you can buy the e-book. It is make you
better to read it. You can save the actual book in your smart phone. Consequently there are a lot of benefits
that you will get when one buys this book.

Edwin Ashford:

Do you like reading a guide? Confuse to looking for your chosen book? Or your book has been rare? Why so
many question for the book? But any kind of people feel that they enjoy for reading. Some people likes
looking at, not only science book and also novel and The Game of God: Recovering Your True Identity or
others sources were given knowledge for you. After you know how the fantastic a book, you feel need to
read more and more. Science publication was created for teacher as well as students especially. Those
ebooks are helping them to include their knowledge. In other case, beside science book, any other book likes
The Game of God: Recovering Your True Identity to make your spare time much more colorful. Many types
of book like this one.

Sylvester Perkins:

Reading a reserve make you to get more knowledge from it. You can take knowledge and information from a
book. Book is prepared or printed or outlined from each source in which filled update of news. Within this
modern era like today, many ways to get information are available for you actually. From media social like
newspaper, magazines, science publication, encyclopedia, reference book, fresh and comic. You can add
your knowledge by that book. Do you want to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just trying
to find the The Game of God: Recovering Your True Identity when you needed it?
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