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From #1 New York Times bestselling author Debbie Macomber comes the first book in a series set in
the beloved Pacific Northwest town of Cedar Cove.

Jo Marie Rose first arrives in Cedar Cove seeking a fresh start. A young widow coping with the death of her
husband, she purchases a local bed-and-breakfast—the newly christened Rose Harbor Inn—ready to begin
her life anew. Her first guest is Joshua Weaver, who has come home to care for his ailing stepfather. The two
have never seen eye to eye, and Joshua has little hope that they can reconcile their differences. Jo Marie’s
other guest is Abby Kincaid, who has returned to Cedar Cove to attend her brother’s wedding. Back for the
first time in twenty years, she almost wishes she hadn’t come, the picturesque town harboring painful
memories. And as Abby and Joshua try to heal from their pasts, and Jo Marie dreams of the possibilities
before her, they all realize that life moves in only one direction—forward.

Praise for Debbie Macomber and The Inn at Rose Harbor

“No one tugs at readers’ heartstrings quite as effectively as [Debbie] Macomber.”—Chicago Tribune

“Debbie Macomber is the reigning queen of women’s fiction.”—The Sacramento Bee
 
“Charming . . . warm and serene . . . a wonderful novel.”—Bookreporter

BONUS: This edition includes a The Inn at Rose Harbor discussion guide, excerpts from Debbie
Macomber’s Rose Harbor in Bloom and Last One Home, and the short story When First They Met.
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From reader reviews:

Brian Price:

Do you have favorite book? Should you have, what is your favorite's book? Reserve is very important thing
for us to learn everything in the world. Each reserve has different aim as well as goal; it means that book has
different type. Some people feel enjoy to spend their time for you to read a book. They can be reading
whatever they acquire because their hobby is usually reading a book. Think about the person who don't like
reading through a book? Sometime, man feel need book when they found difficult problem as well as
exercise. Well, probably you will require this The Inn at Rose Harbor: A Novel.

Jeffrey Gorski:

Reading a reserve can be one of a lot of pastime that everyone in the world really likes. Do you like reading
book so. There are a lot of reasons why people like it. First reading a e-book will give you a lot of new facts.
When you read a e-book you will get new information since book is one of various ways to share the
information or perhaps their idea. Second, reading through a book will make you actually more imaginative.
When you looking at a book especially fictional works book the author will bring you to imagine the story
how the personas do it anything. Third, you could share your knowledge to others. When you read this The
Inn at Rose Harbor: A Novel, it is possible to tells your family, friends and soon about yours reserve. Your
knowledge can inspire different ones, make them reading a book.

James Chapman:

The Inn at Rose Harbor: A Novel can be one of your basic books that are good idea. We all recommend that
straight away because this book has good vocabulary that will increase your knowledge in vocabulary, easy
to understand, bit entertaining however delivering the information. The article writer giving his/her effort to
set every word into joy arrangement in writing The Inn at Rose Harbor: A Novel but doesn't forget the main
point, giving the reader the hottest and also based confirm resource info that maybe you can be among it.
This great information can easily drawn you into fresh stage of crucial contemplating.

Tommy Cowen:

Is it an individual who having spare time then spend it whole day through watching television programs or
just lying down on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This The Inn at Rose Harbor: A Novel can
be the response, oh how comes? The new book you know. You are and so out of date, spending your time by
reading in this brand new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these textbooks have than the others?
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