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Praise for the First Edition:

"This is a valuable resource for new clinical nurse specialists as they begin their journey. It provides
excellent guidance that will help new graduates as they negotiate new positions and develop new roles in
healthcare organizations."  Score: 95, 4 stars

--Doody's

This is a one-of-a-kind, all-inclusive reference guide for new Clinical Nurse Specialists entering the field as
well as seasoned practitioners looking to update their knowledge. Disseminating a wealth of current
professional practice guidance and practical information on reimbursement and certification, the second
edition has been fully updated to reflect changes resulting from the Affordable Care Act and the APRN
Consensus Model.

Four new chapters address changes and emerging trends, expanding focus on independent practice,
increasing demands on health care due to the growing population of older adults, and updated
reimbursement/economic issues. This authoritative toolkit is organized in an easy-to-use, bullet-point format
and includes numerous clinical examples, case scenarios, and personal anecdotes culled from the
contributors' own professional experiences.

New to the Second Edition:

Fully revised and updated●

Addresses CNS practice within Affordable Care Organizations●

Describes CNS leadership role in system-level evidence-based practice initiatives●

Covers documentation and communication of CNS activities aligning with strategic initiatives and CNS●

practice priorities
Discusses facilitating transitions of care to assure safety and quality●

Addresses the CNS role in interprofessional education in clinical settings  ●

Key Features:

Presents crucial information on negotiating and securing a job●

Provides advice on establishing credibility, prioritizing, and finding a mentor●

Contains guidelines on mentoring staff, leading groups, and precepting students●

Addresses documenting and measuring clinical outcomes●

Describes how to network with professional organizations and community agencies●

Offers practical guidance on applying for reimbursement and pursuing certification and licensure●
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From reader reviews:

Willene Choate:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important action, like
looking for your favorite reserve and reading a publication. Beside you can solve your long lasting problem;
you can add your knowledge by the guide entitled Clinical Nurse Specialist Toolkit, Second Edition: A
Guide for the New Clinical Nurse Specialist. Try to make the book Clinical Nurse Specialist Toolkit, Second
Edition: A Guide for the New Clinical Nurse Specialist as your friend. It means that it can to get your friend
when you feel alone and beside that of course make you smarter than previously. Yeah, it is very fortuned for
you personally. The book makes you much more confidence because you can know almost everything by the
book. So , we need to make new experience as well as knowledge with this book.

Mitchell Smith:

Have you spare time for just a day? What do you do when you have more or little spare time? Yep, you can
choose the suitable activity to get spend your time. Any person spent all their spare time to take a stroll,
shopping, or went to the particular Mall. How about open as well as read a book titled Clinical Nurse
Specialist Toolkit, Second Edition: A Guide for the New Clinical Nurse Specialist? Maybe it is for being
best activity for you. You realize beside you can spend your time with your favorite's book, you can smarter
than before. Do you agree with it has the opinion or you have additional opinion?

Della McDonald:

Do you have something that you enjoy such as book? The book lovers usually prefer to select book like
comic, limited story and the biggest an example may be novel. Now, why not hoping Clinical Nurse
Specialist Toolkit, Second Edition: A Guide for the New Clinical Nurse Specialist that give your enjoyment
preference will be satisfied simply by reading this book. Reading practice all over the world can be said as
the way for people to know world considerably better then how they react to the world. It can't be stated
constantly that reading routine only for the geeky man or woman but for all of you who wants to end up
being success person. So , for every you who want to start reading as your good habit, you are able to pick
Clinical Nurse Specialist Toolkit, Second Edition: A Guide for the New Clinical Nurse Specialist become
your personal starter.

Billie Brown:

The book untitled Clinical Nurse Specialist Toolkit, Second Edition: A Guide for the New Clinical Nurse
Specialist contain a lot of information on the idea. The writer explains your ex idea with easy technique. The
language is very clear and understandable all the people, so do not worry, you can easy to read this. The
book was published by famous author. The author will take you in the new time of literary works. You can
actually read this book because you can keep reading your smart phone, or product, so you can read the book
inside anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can available their official web-site along



with order it. Have a nice learn.
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