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For more than twenty years, Charles Templeton was a major figure in the church in Canada and the United
States. During the 1950s, he and Billy Graham were the two most successful exponents of mass evangelism
in North America. Templeton spoke nightly to stadium crowds of up to thirty thousand people.
 
However, increasing doubts about the validity of the Old Testament and the teachings of the Christian church
finally brought about a crisis in his faith and in 1957 he resigned from the ministry.
 
In Farewell to God, Templeton speaks out about his reasons for the abandonment of his faith. In
straightforward language, Templeton deals with such subjects as the Creation fable, racial prejudice in the
Bible, the identity of Jesus of Nazareth, Jesus’ alienation from his family, the second-class status of women
in the church, the mystery of evil, the illusion that prayer works, why there is suffering and death, and the
loss of faith in God.
 
He concludes with a positive personal statement: “I Believe.”

From the eBook edition.
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From reader reviews:

Carolyn Baird:

Now a day those who Living in the era wherever everything reachable by connect to the internet and the
resources inside can be true or not require people to be aware of each info they get. How people have to be
smart in having any information nowadays? Of course the answer is reading a book. Looking at a book can
help persons out of this uncertainty Information particularly this Farewell to God: My Reasons for Rejecting
the Christian Faith book because this book offers you rich info and knowledge. Of course the data in this
book hundred % guarantees there is no doubt in it you may already know.

Jill Goulet:

The feeling that you get from Farewell to God: My Reasons for Rejecting the Christian Faith may be the
more deep you looking the information that hide in the words the more you get interested in reading it. It
does not mean that this book is hard to recognise but Farewell to God: My Reasons for Rejecting the
Christian Faith giving you excitement feeling of reading. The article writer conveys their point in particular
way that can be understood by anyone who read that because the author of this book is well-known enough.
This specific book also makes your own personal vocabulary increase well. It is therefore easy to understand
then can go along with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We suggest you for having this
kind of Farewell to God: My Reasons for Rejecting the Christian Faith instantly.

Ernest Tate:

Do you like reading a publication? Confuse to looking for your preferred book? Or your book ended up
being rare? Why so many problem for the book? But virtually any people feel that they enjoy intended for
reading. Some people likes reading, not only science book but novel and Farewell to God: My Reasons for
Rejecting the Christian Faith as well as others sources were given knowledge for you. After you know how
the fantastic a book, you feel wish to read more and more. Science e-book was created for teacher as well as
students especially. Those books are helping them to include their knowledge. In other case, beside science
guide, any other book likes Farewell to God: My Reasons for Rejecting the Christian Faith to make your
spare time much more colorful. Many types of book like here.

Ashley Robinette:

Reading a e-book make you to get more knowledge from that. You can take knowledge and information
from your book. Book is published or printed or highlighted from each source that filled update of news. On
this modern era like currently, many ways to get information are available for a person. From media social
such as newspaper, magazines, science reserve, encyclopedia, reference book, fresh and comic. You can add
your understanding by that book. Isn't it time to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just seeking
the Farewell to God: My Reasons for Rejecting the Christian Faith when you needed it?
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