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A JOURNEY OF SELF-DISCOVERY - FROM THE DEPTHS OF GRIEF TO THE HEIGHTS OF HOPE
Two years ago, psychotherapist Chris Cameron was devastated by the murder of her partner, Robyn. Even
now she struggles daily with the loss as she once again tries to find meaning in her own life. It isn't going
well. Strangled by her work environment, suffocated by her own overwhelming grief, she finally realizes she
is searching to find her own spirit. The all-encompassing question for her is, "is there life for her after her
love's death?" Living in a culture that offers up psychotropic drugs, celebrity therapists, "reality" television,
junk food, phone sex, credit cards and banal entertainment as diversions from pain and to avoid the
recognition of loss, will Chris be able to rediscover her spirit? Does her resurrection rest within the very
symbol of pain, descansos, the makeshift roadside shrines dotting the landscape of the west that symbolize
loss and transformation? Will Chris ever be able to trust enough to love again? This richly textured novel is a
sharp-witted commentary on contemporary issues such as gay marriage and shamanism. It also takes
roundhouse swipes at religious fundamentalism, Wal-Mart, the decline of psychotherapy as a profession, Fox
News, the media and right wing extremism. A blend of humour, loss, social commentary and relationships,
DESCANSO takes readers on a moving, tragic, yet exhilarating journey from despair to hope and
redemption.
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From reader reviews:

Doris Moreno:

What do you concentrate on book? It is just for students since they're still students or the item for all people
in the world, the particular best subject for that? Just simply you can be answered for that concern above.
Every person has distinct personality and hobby for each and every other. Don't to be pushed someone or
something that they don't need do that. You must know how great as well as important the book Descanso.
All type of book are you able to see on many resources. You can look for the internet solutions or other
social media.

James Dungan:

Nowadays reading books be a little more than want or need but also be a life style. This reading routine give
you lot of advantages. The advantages you got of course the knowledge the particular information inside the
book this improve your knowledge and information. The information you get based on what kind of e-book
you read, if you want attract knowledge just go with education books but if you want sense happy read one
using theme for entertaining including comic or novel. The particular Descanso is kind of publication which
is giving the reader erratic experience.

Maranda Shoemaker:

Information is provisions for people to get better life, information these days can get by anyone at
everywhere. The information can be a information or any news even a problem. What people must be
consider when those information which is inside former life are challenging be find than now could be taking
seriously which one would work to believe or which one often the resource are convinced. If you have the
unstable resource then you obtain it as your main information it will have huge disadvantage for you. All
those possibilities will not happen within you if you take Descanso as the daily resource information.

Andrea Whitt:

On this era which is the greater individual or who has ability to do something more are more valuable than
other. Do you want to become one of it? It is just simple approach to have that. What you should do is just
spending your time almost no but quite enough to enjoy a look at some books. One of the books in the top
listing in your reading list is usually Descanso. This book which is qualified as The Hungry Mountains can
get you closer in becoming precious person. By looking upward and review this e-book you can get many
advantages.
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