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A vivid waking dream of giant cypress trees dripping with Spanish moss haunts Anna St. Thais. The trees sit
on a black lake that resembles a dark Louisiana bayou with an evocative aura. The dream includes the
presence of a man who seems to know Anna all too well and a group of people with strange telepathic
powers, sometimes called veiled eyes. An orphan from Texas, she is on her way east to help out a friend
when she encounters two terrifying things. Psychically, she begins to see and hear things through the eyes of
an unknown individual, a man who knows more about her than she ever would have imagined. The second
thing is that she has been kidnapped by a sociopathic trucker intent on making her his latest victim. When
she is rescued by Gabriel Bergeron, a member of the elusive Lake People in Northwestern Louisiana, Anna
doesn’t realize that he is her psychic counterpart and she has been inexplicably pulled to the area. She shares
their strange colored gold eyes and their distinctive mental powers. They are a reclusive lot and know that
Anna is one of them, but has been isolated by unknown circumstances. She is drawn into their incomparable
world, something between that of the Creoles and Cajuns, and much in addition to those. There Anna finds a
romantic link with Gabriel and the spine-tingling fear of not knowing who to trust. Her return has disturbed
the inner workings of the group and threatens to expose secrets long concealed in the murky Louisiana
bayous. There are secrets to be divulged about her past and why she was spirited away as an infant. Anna
isn’t safe until she discovers the answers she so desperately requires.
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From reader reviews:

Edward Knudsen:

Have you spare time for the day? What do you do when you have a lot more or little spare time? Yeah, you
can choose the suitable activity intended for spend your time. Any person spent their own spare time to take
a move, shopping, or went to the actual Mall. How about open or even read a book entitled Veiled Eyes
(Lake People Book 1)? Maybe it is for being best activity for you. You realize beside you can spend your
time together with your favorite's book, you can smarter than before. Do you agree with its opinion or you
have additional opinion?

Clara Reece:

Nowadays reading books be than want or need but also be a life style. This reading behavior give you lot of
advantages. The huge benefits you got of course the knowledge the actual information inside the book this
improve your knowledge and information. The information you get based on what kind of publication you
read, if you want send more knowledge just go with education and learning books but if you want really feel
happy read one with theme for entertaining including comic or novel. The actual Veiled Eyes (Lake People
Book 1) is kind of guide which is giving the reader capricious experience.

James Fitzgibbons:

Reading a book to get new life style in this season; every people loves to examine a book. When you study a
book you can get a wide range of benefit. When you read ebooks, you can improve your knowledge, due to
the fact book has a lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on what sorts of book
that you have read. In order to get information about your analysis, you can read education books, but if you
want to entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, these kinds of us novel, comics, as well as soon.
The Veiled Eyes (Lake People Book 1) provide you with new experience in looking at a book.

Catherine Lyons:

As we know that book is very important thing to add our know-how for everything. By a publication we can
know everything we wish. A book is a group of written, printed, illustrated or perhaps blank sheet. Every
year was exactly added. This guide Veiled Eyes (Lake People Book 1) was filled with regards to science.
Spend your free time to add your knowledge about your scientific research competence. Some people has
different feel when they reading a new book. If you know how big good thing about a book, you can really
feel enjoy to read a e-book. In the modern era like today, many ways to get book which you wanted.
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