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Argues that philosophy, as multidisciplinary comparative inquiry, is essential to the contemporary academic
study of religion.

What can philosophy contribute to the study of religion? This book argues that the study of religion needs
philosophy in the form of multidisciplinary comparative inquiry. Contradicting the current tendency to
regard philosophical reflection and the academic study of religion as independent endeavors best kept apart,
Wesley J. Wildman brings them together, offering a broader vision than that of traditional “philosophy of
religion” and surmounting many of its difficulties. His newer conception of “religious philosophy” is well
suited to the modern, multicultural, secular university. Through multidisciplinary comparative inquiry,
religious philosophy allows for a variety of approaches—from historical and analytical work to evocative
description and theoretical evaluation of truth claims—and both secular and religious thinkers participate.
The tasks and varieties of religious philosophy as they arc across the world’s religions and philosophies are
discussed along with religious philosophy’s modern and postmodern contexts. Wildman’s thoughtful and
thought-provoking book will be essential reading for all those concerned with the study of religion, present
and future.

“…Religious Philosophy as Multidisciplinary Comparative Inquiry has the potential to be a significant game
changer for scholars of theology, philosophy, and religion.” — American Journal of Theology and
Philosophy

“Wildman offers a bold and sweeping work that defends the relevance and necessity of the enterprise
traditionally known as philosophy of religion by offering a comprehensive overhaul of its basic methods and
self-understanding.” — CHOICE

“This is an immensely ambitious and wide-ranging book, advocating ‘religious philosophy’ as a
multidisciplinary comparative inquiry, with an important part to play in any liberal college education. It
expounds a view of rational inquiry as fallibilist, hypothetical and pragmatic. Although it is primarily an
inquiry into the methodology of religious philosophy, in fact it provides a mine of information about
postmodernity, comparative religion, and trends in modern philosophy of religion, among other things. The
book sets a positive agenda for future work in theology, religious studies, and comparative philosophy. It is
an agenda that is new, well argued, and which I hope will be very influential in higher education, and it is set
to be a formative work in the field.” — Keith Ward, author of The Word of God? The Bible after Modern
Scholarship
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From reader reviews:

Angela Hampton:

This Religious Philosophy as Multidisciplinary Comparative Inquiry: Envisioning a Future for the
Philosophy of Religion are usually reliable for you who want to certainly be a successful person, why. The
main reason of this Religious Philosophy as Multidisciplinary Comparative Inquiry: Envisioning a Future for
the Philosophy of Religion can be among the great books you must have is definitely giving you more than
just simple reading food but feed a person with information that probably will shock your prior knowledge.
This book is usually handy, you can bring it all over the place and whenever your conditions both in e-book
and printed versions. Beside that this Religious Philosophy as Multidisciplinary Comparative Inquiry:
Envisioning a Future for the Philosophy of Religion giving you an enormous of experience like rich
vocabulary, giving you tryout of critical thinking that could it useful in your day task. So , let's have it and
revel in reading.

Maria Davis:

Reading a publication tends to be new life style in this era globalization. With examining you can get a lot of
information which will give you benefit in your life. Using book everyone in this world may share their idea.
Guides can also inspire a lot of people. A great deal of author can inspire their own reader with their story or
even their experience. Not only the storyplot that share in the publications. But also they write about the
ability about something that you need instance. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach children,
there are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors on earth always try to improve their expertise in
writing, they also doing some exploration before they write with their book. One of them is this Religious
Philosophy as Multidisciplinary Comparative Inquiry: Envisioning a Future for the Philosophy of Religion.

Sherrie Smith:

Reading can called head hangout, why? Because if you are reading a book especially book entitled Religious
Philosophy as Multidisciplinary Comparative Inquiry: Envisioning a Future for the Philosophy of Religion
your brain will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in every aspect that maybe unidentified for but
surely will become your mind friends. Imaging each and every word written in a e-book then become one
contact form conclusion and explanation this maybe you never get prior to. The Religious Philosophy as
Multidisciplinary Comparative Inquiry: Envisioning a Future for the Philosophy of Religion giving you a
different experience more than blown away your mind but also giving you useful data for your better life
within this era. So now let us demonstrate the relaxing pattern here is your body and mind is going to be
pleased when you are finished looking at it, like winning a casino game. Do you want to try this
extraordinary paying spare time activity?

John Barstow:

You may get this Religious Philosophy as Multidisciplinary Comparative Inquiry: Envisioning a Future for



the Philosophy of Religion by browse the bookstore or Mall. Merely viewing or reviewing it might to be
your solve challenge if you get difficulties for your knowledge. Kinds of this publication are various. Not
only simply by written or printed but can you enjoy this book simply by e-book. In the modern era just like
now, you just looking by your local mobile phone and searching what their problem. Right now, choose your
own ways to get more information about your reserve. It is most important to arrange yourself to make your
knowledge are still revise. Let's try to choose right ways for you.
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